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GRADReCon: Graduate Research Connections

Build your productivity, research, and writing skills at GRADReCon: Graduate Research Connections! A
smorgasbord of workshops on topics essential to your success at Mason, GRADReCon is a partnership of
Graduate Student Life, University Libraries, and other key University programs and services for grad students.
Topics include research funding, grant writing, project management, writing literature reviews, authorship and
publication, and more.

Questions? Contact gradlife@gmu.edu

More information is available here.

International Symposium on DTx, Digital Therapeutics

AI Ethics and AI Efficacy

ORAU 2023 Annual Meeting Registration Now Open

ORAU would like to invite you to attend our 2023 Annual Council Meeting focused on Climate Security and
Environmental Justice: Pathways to Achieving the 2050 Carbon Net-Zero Goal. Your participation will provide
an opportunity for you and your colleagues to discuss key technology, economic, and policy challenges and
opportunities. Experts and leaders from academia, federal agencies, and national organizations will share their
views on Technology Innovation and Transformation, Science-Based Models for an Environmentally Equitable
Society, and Growing Future Thought Leaders through Strategic Alliances.

Registration Deadline: February 28, 2023

Event Session: Monday, March 6 - Tuesday, March 7, 2023 at the Knoxville Airport Hilton

Register here.

Summer Team Impact Projects

The Office of the Provost is excited to offer grants for Summer Team Impact Projects (STIP) for Summer 2023.
The Offices of Undergraduate Education, OSCAR, and CECiL will fund multidisciplinary summer projects for
undergraduate students, graduate students, and faculty members. These projects will explore a central theme, a
research question, or a community-identified problem. Proposals focusing on the U.N.'s Global Goals or Anti-
Racist Community Engagement are encouraged.

Proposal Deadline: November 18, 2022

More information is available here.

Ford Foundation Fellowship Programs

Through its program of fellowships, the Ford Foundation seeks to increase the diversity of the nation’s college
and university faculties by increasing their ethnic and racial diversity, maximizing the educational benefits of
diversity, and increasing the number of professors who can and will use diversity as a resource for enriching the
education of all students.

Dissertation and Postdoctoral Application Deadline: December 8, 2022 by 5:00 pm EST

Predoctoral Application Deadline: December 15, 2022 by 5:00 pm EST

More information is available here.

Call for Submissions: Network for Undergraduate Research

National Conference on Undergraduate Research

Research Assistant Positions

Request for Proposal: Digital Crowbar

The Directorate of Digital Innovation/Digital Futures, in cooperation with the Office of Mission Applications
(OMA) (herein referred to as "The Sponsor"), is seeking white papers with the potential for a selection to
commercially develop a Proof of Concept (PoC) capability to protect sensitive text and image queries by
obscuring them. The Sponsor may examine either existing commercial capabilities or custom-built proofs of
concept from commercial labs. For example, a user could specify specific text and image search parameters (i.e.
name or image of interest) to query specific data sources and/or platform data repositories. In this case,
associated capabilities would support the transformation of text and image queries to ensure sensitive search
terms' interests are hidden and not obvious to untrusted data owners, while privacy is maintained and valid
query results containing information relevant to the original, sensitive query are returned.

The SOO for the BAA is available here. 

Questions? Contact Mike Bunting at mbuntin@gmu.edu

White Paper Deadline: Monday, November 7 by 5:00 pm EST 

Public-Private Analytic Exchange Program

The Department of Homeland Security and Office of the Director of National Intelligence invite analysts who
are U.S. citizens to apply for the 2023 Public-Private Analytic Exchange Program (AEP).  

Application Deadline: Monday, November 14, 2022

More information is available here.

Congratulations to:

Zeng, Kai from the College of Engineering and Computing for receiving the U.S. Department of the Navy grant
on Spectrum-Efficient, Beam-Agile, Interference-Resilient Millimeter Wave Communications with
Reconfigurable Antennas and Intelligent Surfaces.

Beheshti, Ali from the College of Engineering and Computing and co-PI Bagheri, Shaghayegh for receiving
the University of Michigan grant on Automotive Research Center (ARC) A Center for Excellence In Modeling
and Simulation of Ground Vehicles Supported by the National Automotive Center.

Roeting, William H. from the College of Engineering and Computing and co-PIs Wijesekera, Duminda and
Kobsar, Joseph T. for receiving the U.S. Department of the Army grant on Chief Digital and AI Office
(CDAO) Other Transactional Agreement and Public Private Partnership.

Costa, Paulo Cesar from the College of Engineering and Computing for receiving the Virginia Tech grant on
DALNIM: Dependency-based Assessment of Litigious Network events Impacting the Mission.

Jafri, Mohsin Saleet from the College of Science for receiving the Pathodynamics, LLC grant on Prediction of
Cancer Drug Resistance to Aid in Clinical Decision Making.

Baldimtsi, Foteini from the College of Engineering and Computing for receiving the Silicon Valley Community
Foundation grant on PhD Fellowship Proposal: New Directions in Proof of Storage.

Communications, Circuits, and Sensing-Systems (CCSS)

Continuous Submission  

Electronics, Photonics, and Magnetic Devices (EPMD)

Continuous Submission 

Did you know that, as an IDIA faculty affiliate, you are eligible to:

Compete for internally funded IDIA projects

Receive support for IDIA-relevant events

Become part of the dynamic multidisciplinary faculty network focused on digital techniques and technologies
to advance fields as diverse as finance, education, built infrastructure, science, economics, agriculture, health,
transportation, entertainment, national security, and social justice.

There is no financial burden to you or your departments for affiliation with the institute. Participation in IDIA
does not prevent its members from being associated with other university centers. If you are not already
affiliated, we encourage you to submit your profile here.
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